

ID	WBS	Task Name	% Complete	Work	Duration	Start	Finish	Predecessors	Resource Names
1	1	DOI-USDAFS_Computer_Aided_Dispatch	4%	1,790.48 hrs	174.54 days?	Wed 2/29/12	Mon 11/5/12		
2	1.1	Milestones	0%	0 hrs	39 days?	Mon 5/7/12	Fri 6/29/12		
3	1.1.1	Response from RFI	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Fri 6/29/12	Fri 6/29/12		
4	1.1.2	Finalize CAD Business Requirements	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 5/7/12		
5	1.1.3	Develop a comprehensive interagency strategy for a unified CAD system	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 5/7/12		
6	1.1.4	Complete project scope document	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 5/7/12		
7	1.1.5	Complete Security Requirements	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 5/7/12		
8	1.1.6	Complete 508 Compliance documentation	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 5/7/12		
9	1.1.7	Complete lessons learned	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 5/7/12		
10	1.1.8	Project closure	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 5/7/12		
11	1.2	Initiation	82%	20.5 hrs	35 days	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 6/25/12		
12	1.2.1	Create and submit SR	0%	0.5 hrs	2 days	Fri 6/22/12	Mon 6/25/12		Richey; Eileen[3%]
13	1.2.2	Create charter	100%	20 hrs	9 days	Mon 5/7/12	Thu 5/17/12		Hill; Laura[28%]
14	1.3	Planning	20%	12 hrs	30 days	Fri 5/18/12	Fri 6/29/12		
15	1.3.1	Charter approval	0%	4 hrs	30 days	Fri 5/18/12	Fri 6/29/12	13	Douglas; Jim[1%],Phipps; Joh
16	1.3.2	Create the project plan	50%	8 hrs	20 days	Wed 5/30/12	Tue 6/26/12	13FS+7 days	Richey; Eileen[40%]
17	1.4	Execution	1%	1,058.65 hrs	174.54 days?	Wed 2/29/12	Mon 11/5/12		
18	1.4.1	Communication	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 5/7/12		
19	1.4.1.1	Develop a communication plan	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 5/7/12		
20	1.4.2	Study current CAD program elements to include historical information and reports	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Mon 5/7/12	Mon 5/7/12		
21	1.4.3	Identify CAD business requirements	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Tue 5/8/12	Tue 5/8/12	20	
22	1.4.4	Identify Enterprise and Segment Architecture requirements	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 5/9/12	Wed 5/9/12	21	
23	1.4.5	Develop a comprehensive interagency strategy for a unified CAD system	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Thu 5/10/12	Thu 5/10/12	22	
24	1.4.6	Business Process Analysis	0%	0 hrs	3 days?	Fri 5/11/12	Tue 5/15/12		
25	1.4.6.1	Conduct a Business Process Analysis (BPA) on CAD functions	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Fri 5/11/12	Fri 5/11/12	23	
26	1.4.6.2	Compare to Agency needs	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Mon 5/14/12	Mon 5/14/12	25	
27	1.4.6.3	Conduct and document Alternatives Analysis (AA) in both qualitative and quantitative measurement areas	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Tue 5/15/12	Tue 5/15/12	26	
28	1.4.7	Develop and deliver pre-briefing paper to Directors, IRB, IRDB	0%	4 hrs	4 days	Tue 5/29/12	Fri 6/1/12		
29	1.4.8	Develop a Management and Product Scope document to support business case	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 5/16/12	Wed 5/16/12	27	
30	1.4.9	Develop an Acquisition Strategy	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Thu 5/17/12	Thu 5/17/12	29	
31	1.4.10	Develop an Request for Information (RFI)	100%	4 hrs	2 days	Tue 5/29/12	Wed 5/30/12	13	Guenther; Dale[8%],Chuck[8%
32	1.4.11	Response from RFI	0%	8 hrs	22 days	Thu 5/31/12	Fri 6/29/12	31	
33	1.4.12	Develop Formal Briefing paper for Directors, DOI-IRB,FS- IRDB	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
34	1.4.13	Develop an Acquisition Management Plan by refining Acquisition Strategy	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Fri 5/18/12	Fri 5/18/12	30	
35	1.4.14	Refine CAD business requirements	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 5/9/12	Wed 5/9/12	21	
36	1.4.15	Develop national CAD standards	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Thu 5/10/12	Thu 5/10/12	35	
37	1.4.16	Develop a Request for Proposal (RFP)	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Thu 5/31/12	Thu 5/31/12	31	

ID	WBS	Task Name	% Complete	Work	Duration	Start	Finish	Predecessors	Resource Names
38	1.4.17	Identify and establish funding sources and allocations for the business case	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Mon 5/21/12	Mon 5/21/12	34	
39	1.4.18	Develop appropriate Business Case Assessment for IRDB and IRB review and funding	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Tue 5/22/12	Tue 5/22/12	38	
40	1.4.19	Make a recommendation regarding the formal assignment of a Managing Partner for this project effort	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 6/13/12	Wed 6/13/12		
41	1.4.20	Outline roles and responsibilities of the designated Managing Partner that support MOA/IAA between DOI and FS	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Thu 6/14/12	Thu 6/14/12	40	
42	1.4.21	Prepare briefing paper for appropriate executives and leadership to obtain project approval and direction	16%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	39	
43	1.4.22	Review the potential for cloud computing	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Thu 6/21/12	Thu 6/21/12	42	
44	1.4.23	508 Compliance	0%	0 hrs	2 days?	Fri 6/22/12	Mon 6/25/12	43	
45	1.4.23.1	COTS must meet all national 508 compliance standards	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Fri 6/22/12	Fri 6/22/12		
46	1.4.23.2	All 508 documentation must be completed and available	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Mon 6/25/12	Mon 6/25/12	45	
47	1.4.24	Review available COTS CAD software	0%	64.8 hrs	81 days	Tue 6/26/12	Fri 10/19/12	44	
48	1.4.25	Create a new contract for CAD software	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Mon 10/22/12	Mon 10/22/12	47	
49	1.4.26	Award and Implement a National Contract and/or setting of national standards for CAD	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Tue 10/23/12	Tue 10/23/12	48	
50	1.4.27	Purchase COTS for National Interagency CAD (COTS)	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 10/24/12	Wed 10/24/12	49	
51	1.4.28	Purchase licenses for COTS software	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Thu 10/25/12	Thu 10/25/12	50	
52	1.4.29	Architecture Design	0%	134.7 hrs	7.54 days	Thu 10/25/12	Mon 11/5/12		
53	1.4.29.1	Work with project team to complete a robust architectural design	0%	14.7 hrs	0.66 days	Thu 10/25/12	Thu 10/25/12		
54	1.4.29.2	Review preliminary architectural design (TAG, Arch)	0%	16 hrs	1.2 days	Thu 10/25/12	Fri 10/26/12	53	
55	1.4.29.3	Identify issues/risk/dependencies	0%	8 hrs	5.68 days	Fri 10/26/12	Mon 11/5/12	54	
56	1.4.29.4	Develop architectural diagram with specifications	0%	20 hrs	0.83 days	Fri 10/26/12	Fri 10/26/12		
57	1.4.29.5	Review architectural diagram/ specifications	0%	8 hrs	0.5 days	Fri 10/26/12	Mon 10/29/12	56	
58	1.4.29.6	Incorporate feedback into architectural specifications	0%	16 hrs	0.67 days	Mon 10/29/12	Mon 10/29/12	57	
59	1.4.29.7	Backup strategy when connectivity is down	0%	8 hrs	1 day	Tue 10/30/12	Tue 10/30/12	58	
60	1.4.29.8	Develop architecture decisions document	0%	8 hrs	0.33 days	Wed 10/31/12	Wed 10/31/12	59	
61	1.4.29.9	Develop a system context diagram	0%	8 hrs	0.33 days	Wed 10/31/12	Wed 10/31/12	60	
62	1.4.29.10	Prepare logical operations model	0%	16 hrs	1.67 days	Wed 10/31/12	Fri 11/2/12	61	
63	1.4.29.11	Prepare architecture review presentation	0%	8 hrs	0.33 days	Fri 11/2/12	Fri 11/2/12	62	
64	1.4.29.12	Obtain approval to proceed	0%	4 hrs	0.25 days	Fri 11/2/12	Fri 11/2/12	63	
65	1.4.29.13	Architecture Design complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Fri 11/2/12	Fri 11/2/12	64	
66	1.4.30	Helpdesk Support	0%	173.33 hrs	97 days?	Wed 2/29/12	Mon 7/16/12		
67	1.4.30.1	CHD initial meeting	0%	32 hrs	0.8 days?	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
68	1.4.30.2	Develop helpdesk specifications	0%	8 hrs	25 days	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 4/4/12	67	
69	1.4.30.3	Develop helpdesk KM documentation	0%	40 hrs	20 days	Wed 4/4/12	Wed 5/2/12	68	
70	1.4.30.4	Review helpdesk KM documentation	0%	4 hrs	5 days	Wed 5/2/12	Wed 5/9/12	69	
71	1.4.30.5	Publish KM documentation	0%	2 hrs	5 days	Wed 5/9/12	Wed 5/16/12	70	
72	1.4.30.6	Helpdesk support complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 5/16/12	Wed 5/16/12	71	
73	1.4.30.7	Development / PHE	0%	81.27 hrs	88.22 days?	Wed 2/29/12	Tue 7/3/12		
74	1.4.30.7.1	Intake Analysis	0%	22.23 hrs	88.09 days?	Wed 2/29/12	Tue 7/3/12		
75	1.4.30.7.1.1	Assign team to this task	0%	4 hrs	0.5 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		

ID	WBS	Task Name	% Complete	Work	Duration	Start	Finish	Predecessors	Resource Names
76	1.4.30.7.1.2	Create intake form	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
77	1.4.30.7.1.3	Review of Intake form	0%	4 hrs	5 days	Wed 6/20/12	Tue 6/26/12		
78	1.4.30.7.1.4	Request more info from the client if needed	0%	2.17 hrs	2.71 days	Wed 6/27/12	Fri 6/29/12	77	
79	1.4.30.7.1.5	Add tasks to JIRA	0%	10 hrs	1.25 days	Fri 6/29/12	Mon 7/2/12	78	
80	1.4.30.7.1.6	Notify EM or Client if account creations are necessa	0%	2.07 hrs	0.13 days	Mon 7/2/12	Tue 7/3/12	79	
81	1.4.30.7.2	Network Engineering	0%	57.03 hrs	9.22 days	Wed 6/20/12	Tue 7/3/12		
82	1.4.30.7.2.1	Request IP/DNS Entry or Oracle VIPS	0%	1.03 hrs	0.13 days	Tue 7/3/12	Tue 7/3/12	80	
83	1.4.30.7.2.2	Set up network connectivity coming in	0%	40 hrs	2.5 days	Wed 6/20/12	Fri 6/22/12		
84	1.4.30.7.2.3	Determine type of security needed for PHE connec	0%	16 hrs	2 days	Fri 6/22/12	Tue 6/26/12	83	
85	1.4.30.7.3	Apps Installation	0%	2 hrs	0.25 days	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
86	1.4.30.7.3.1	install application software	0%	2 hrs	0.25 days	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
87	1.4.30.7.4	Development / PHE complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
88	1.4.30.8	UAT, Functional, Integration Test	0%	0 hrs	97 days?	Wed 2/29/12	Mon 7/16/12		
89	1.4.30.8.1	Prepare test plan	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
90	1.4.30.8.2	Conduct functional tests by all agencies	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
91	1.4.30.8.3	Functional tests complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
92	1.4.30.8.4	UAT complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
93	1.4.30.8.5	Develop Application Release Notice	0%	0 hrs	18 days	Wed 6/20/12	Mon 7/16/12		
94	1.4.30.8.6	Conduct integraton testing	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
95	1.4.30.8.7	Integration testing Complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
96	1.4.30.9	Validation	0%	1.03 hrs	0.13 days	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
97	1.4.30.9.1	validate systems operational and can be access by clie	0%	1.03 hrs	0.13 days	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
98	1.4.30.10	Deliver	0%	5.03 hrs	1 day?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
99	1.4.30.10.1	Prepare Server Release Spreadsheet/Attach to JIRA Pr	0%	4 hrs	0.5 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
100	1.4.30.10.2	Verify the client was able to access their servers	0%	1.03 hrs	0.13 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
101	1.4.30.10.3	Close the JIRA project	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	100	
102	1.4.30.10.4	Ready to move to PRP	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
103	1.4.30.11	Development / PHE complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
104	1.4.31	Security	0%	1 hr	14 days?	Thu 5/31/12	Wed 6/20/12		
105	1.4.31.1	Establish clear security protocols to meet agency/bureau requirements	0%	1 hr	1 day	Thu 5/31/12	Thu 5/31/12	31	
106	1.4.31.2	Meet Federal Security Requirements (FISMA 2002)	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Fri 6/1/12	Fri 6/1/12	105	
107	1.4.31.3	COTS must meet all National Institute of Standards and Technologies security requirements	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Mon 6/4/12	Mon 6/4/12	106	
108	1.4.31.4	Application/Data Security Review	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
109	1.4.31.4.1	Required Steps	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
110	1.4.31.4.1.1	PTA	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
111	1.4.31.4.1.2	App Categorization	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	110	Customer[25%],Security Oper,
112	1.4.31.4.1.3	App Questionnaire (App Q)	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	111	Customer[25%],Security Oper,
113	1.4.31.4.2	C&A	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
114	1.4.31.4.2.1	Identify security requirements for CAD software	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
115	1.4.31.4.2.2	Privacy Impact Assessment (if required, dependant	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
116	1.4.31.4.2.3	Security Categorization Document	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		

ID	WBS	Task Name	% Complete	Work	Duration	Start	Finish	Predecessors	Resource Names
117	1.4.31.4.2.4	Security Risk Assessment	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
118	1.4.31.4.2.5	System Security Plan	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
119	1.4.31.4.2.6	Additional Security Required Documentation Suppc	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
120	1.4.31.4.2.7	C&A complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
121	1.4.32	Pre-Production	0%	309.78 hrs	102 days?	Wed 2/29/12	Mon 7/23/12		
122	1.4.32.1	Intake Analysis	0%	14.02 hrs	80.41 days	Wed 2/29/12	Thu 6/21/12		
123	1.4.32.1.1	Assign team to this task	0%	0.5 hrs	0.5 hrs	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
124	1.4.32.1.2	Add tasks to JIRA	0%	10 hrs	1.25 days	Wed 6/20/12	Thu 6/21/12	123	
125	1.4.32.1.3	Notify EM or Client if account creations are necessary	0%	1.52 hrs	0.09 days	Thu 6/21/12	Thu 6/21/12	124	
126	1.4.32.1.4	Apps Installation	0%	2 hrs	0.25 days	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
127	1.4.32.1.4.1	install application software	0%	2 hrs	0.25 days	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
128	1.4.32.2	PRP Build Verification and Validation	0%	9.03 hrs	1 day	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
131	1.4.32.3	Testing begins	0%	253.7 hrs	102 days?	Wed 2/29/12	Mon 7/23/12		
157	1.4.32.4	Deliver	0%	5.03 hrs	0.63 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
160	1.4.32.5	Release	0%	28 hrs	2 days	Wed 6/20/12	Thu 6/21/12		
164	1.4.33	Pre-production complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
165	1.4.34	Reviews	0%	0 hrs	83 days?	Wed 2/29/12	Mon 6/25/12		
166	1.4.34.1	CAB Review	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
167	1.4.34.2	Prepare materials for CMB	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Thu 6/21/12	Thu 6/21/12	166	
168	1.4.34.3	Present to CMB	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Fri 6/22/12	Fri 6/22/12	167	
169	1.4.34.4	Prepare for Partnership Council review	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Mon 6/25/12	Mon 6/25/12	168	
170	1.4.34.5	Present to Partnership Council	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 2/29/12	Wed 2/29/12		
171	1.4.35	Prepare communication announcing new product	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
172	1.4.36	Production	0%	32.03 hrs	1.75 days?	Wed 6/20/12	Thu 6/21/12		
173	1.4.36.1	Intake Analysis	0%	14 hrs	1.75 days	Wed 6/20/12	Thu 6/21/12		
174	1.4.36.1.1	Assign team to this task	0%	4 hrs	0.5 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
175	1.4.36.1.2	Add tasks to JIRA	0%	10 hrs	1.25 days	Wed 6/20/12	Thu 6/21/12	174	
176	1.4.36.2	Apps Build	0%	2 hrs	0.25 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
177	1.4.36.2.1	Install App into Prod	0%	2 hrs	0.25 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
178	1.4.36.3	PROD Build Verification and Validation	0%	1.03 hrs	0.13 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
179	1.4.36.3.1	Validate systems operational and can be access by clien	0%	1.03 hrs	0.13 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
180	1.4.36.4	Deliver	0%	9 hrs	0.75 days?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
181	1.4.36.4.1	Ops Production Review	0%	2 hrs	0.25 days?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	179	
182	1.4.36.4.2	Ops Monitoring	0%	4 hrs	0.5 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
183	1.4.36.4.3	Notify Customer of Installed Application in PROD	0%	1 hr	0.13 days?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	182	
184	1.4.36.4.4	Customer Acceptance	0%	2 hrs	0.13 days?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	183	
185	1.4.36.5	Producton configuraton complete	100%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
186	1.4.36.6	Release Mgr review	0%	6 hrs	0.75 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
187	1.4.36.6.1	Identify date application installed into production	0%	2 hrs	0.25 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
188	1.4.36.6.2	Was UAT Successful?	0%	2 hrs	0.25 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	187	
189	1.4.36.6.3	Date that sponsor accepted application into production	0%	2 hrs	0.25 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	188	
190	1.4.37	Training	0%	6 hrs	0.25 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		

ID	WBS	Task Name	% Complete	Work	Duration	Start	Finish	Predecessors	Resource Names
191	1.4.37.1	Conduct training session for end users	0%	6 hrs	2 hrs	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
192	1.4.38	KM	0%	1 hr	6 days?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/27/12		
193	1.4.38.1	Preliminary meeting with DOI, FS helpdesks	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 6/27/12	Wed 6/27/12		
194	1.4.38.2	Determine which KM documents are needed	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
195	1.4.38.3	Prepare KM documents	0%	1 hr	1 day	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	194	
196	1.4.38.4	Post KM	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Thu 6/21/12	Thu 6/21/12	195	
197	1.4.39	Pilot testing	0%	304 hrs	65.83 days?	Fri 6/22/12	Tue 9/25/12		
198	1.4.39.1	Conduct pilot testing	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Fri 6/22/12	Fri 6/22/12	196	
199	1.4.39.2	Pilot (Phase 1)	0%	304 hrs	64.83 days	Mon 6/25/12	Tue 9/25/12	198	
200	1.4.39.2.1	Conduct training for pilot users	0%	0 hrs	15 days	Mon 6/25/12	Mon 7/16/12		
201	1.4.39.2.2	CIO support to the pilot effort	0%	8 hrs	1 day	Tue 7/17/12	Tue 7/17/12	200	
202	1.4.39.2.3	Install/deploy software	0%	8 hrs	1 day	Wed 7/18/12	Wed 7/18/12	201	
203	1.4.39.2.4	Execute pilot test	0%	240 hrs	45 days	Thu 7/19/12	Thu 9/20/12	202	
204	1.4.39.2.5	Obtain user feedback	0%	40 hrs	2.5 days	Fri 9/21/12	Tue 9/25/12	203	
205	1.4.39.2.6	Evaluate testing information	0%	8 hrs	0.33 days	Tue 9/25/12	Tue 9/25/12	204	
206	1.4.39.3	Pilot complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Tue 9/25/12	Tue 9/25/12	205	
207	1.4.40	Deployment Analysis	0%	16 hrs	1.33 days	Wed 6/20/12	Thu 6/21/12		
208	1.4.40.1	Determine deployment strategy	0%	8 hrs	0.33 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
209	1.4.40.2	Secure deployment resources	0%	8 hrs	1 day	Wed 6/20/12	Thu 6/21/12	208	
210	1.4.40.3	Deployment analysis complete	100%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12	209	
211	1.4.41	Post Implementation Review	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
212	1.4.41.1	Gather lessons learned information	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
213	1.4.41.2	Publish with project documentaiton	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
214	1.5	Implementation	0%	5 hrs	37 days?	Wed 6/20/12	Fri 8/10/12		
215	1.5.1	Deployment of chosen COTS software	0%	1 hr	1 day	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
216	1.5.2	Tracking progress on this project	0%	4 hrs	37 days?	Wed 6/20/12	Fri 8/10/12		
217	1.6	Project closure	0%	694.33 hrs	6.5 days?	Wed 6/20/12	Thu 6/28/12		
218	1.6.1	Complete project closure documentaton	0%	24 hrs	1 day	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		
219	1.6.2	Closure meeting	0%	0 hrs	1 day?	Thu 6/21/12	Thu 6/21/12	218	
220	1.6.3	Verify all deliverables	0%	24 hrs	1 day	Fri 6/22/12	Fri 6/22/12	219	
221	1.6.4	Close project	0%	646.33 hrs	3.5 days	Mon 6/25/12	Thu 6/28/12	220	
222	1.6.5	Project closure complete	0%	0 hrs	0 days	Wed 6/20/12	Wed 6/20/12		